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This five-member group travels to the United States to discuss with their American colleagues the 
teaching of architecture and design. Representing the original „Bauhaus“ School of Architecture and 
Engineering in Weimar, Germany, our group will be among those who will found a new Institute of Art 
and Design at the Weimar College of Architecture. 

The Institute, like many academic, commercial, and social institutions in the former East Germany, is 
now in the process of re-making itself, and hopes to do so in a way which will balance the heavy emp-
hasis on engineering which characterized the school‘s curriculum during the GDR period. This trip 
provides the school with a unique opportunity to shape a whole college department and an art and 
design curriculum for coming generations of Germans- eastern and wester alike--at the original home 
of the „Bauhaus“ theoreticians.

During their stay in the U.S., the members of the delegation will be particularly interested in discussing 
possible model curricula and the ideas and philosophy behind such curricula. They would appreciate 
the opportunity to discuss with their American colleagues how schools in the U.S. teach design, inter-
ior design, and architecture, and how esthetic issues are woven into these subjects. The group is also 
interested in the use of computer-assisted design and other high-tech approaches to design instruction.
The group‘s interests cover a wide range of styles, from the avant-garde and progressive through the 
traditional; they are particularly interested in the „neo-traditional“ New York academy, but would not 
want to miss examples of mainstream art and design education as well. In short, the group is eager to 
observe, discuss, and experience the fullest range possible of art and design education in America.

This will be the first trip to the United States for all members of the group. The group looks forward to 
the cultural as well as the professional aspects of the trip, and would welcome opportunities for home 
hospitality and home stays where their limited English would not be a problem.

Your stay in  Boston  will feature visits to some of the best-known institutes of architecture, art and 
design in the United States, where you will be able to discuss such subjects as curriculum develop-
ment, philosophy of approach, and the use of advanced teaching aids. Amaong the possible stopa are 
the Graduate School of Design at Harvard University, the School of Architecture at the Massachusetts 
Institute of Technology, the Massachusets College of Art, and the Arts School of the Museum of Fine 
Arts. If time permits, a meeting may be arranged with Dr. Peter Schmitt of the Goethe Institute, who 
appreciates opportunities to meet with visitors from eastern Germany.

The focus of your brief stay in  Providence  will be a visit to the Rhode Island School of Design (RISD). 
At RISD, you are likely to have a series of appointments with faculty and staff which will allow you to 
learn more about how this highly-respected institution operates. If sufficient time is available. other 
such institutes in the Providence area may be included in your program. An evening of informal home 
hospitality has been planned for you which will include several prominent architects in the area.

This metropolis offers a dazzling array of resources related to architecture, art and design. Its numerous 
schools represent a wide variety of styles and philosophies, as do the many architectural and design 
firms located here. Among those likely to be included in your two-day itinerary are the Pratt Institute, 
the Parson School of Design, and the offices of Beyer/Blinder/Belle. Other possibilities include Michael 
Graves‘ well-known architectural design studio, the School of Visual Arts, the Art Students League, and 
Cooper Union, a small (20‘ students) institution which operates on a scholarship-only basis, charging 
no tuttion. Your weekend in  New York  will allow you amplé time to shop or visit some of the city‘s 
famous tourist attractions.

As you continue your journey down the northeast coast of the United States, your stop in Philadelphia, 
as in Boston, will enable you to see some of our country‘s most famous historical architecture, which 
dates back to our war of independence from Great Britain and the infancy of the United States. Chief 
among these would be Independence Hall, where the Declaration of Independence and the Constitu-
tion were signed. Your program in Philadelphia will include several academic institutions and design 
firms, and prominent among the former may be the University of the Arts, which is noted for its use of 
computer technology in its Department of Industrial Design. It may be possible to visit the offices of 
noted architect Robert Venturi, as you had requested, although Mr. Venturi himself may be travelling 
elsewhere during your stay in Philadelphia. Your sponsor will be arranging home hospitality, affording 
you the opportunity to learn about life in the United States through informal discussions with partici-
pants from the community.

Home of the first skyscraper (11 stories; the current record-holder has ten times as many), Chicago has 
long had a strong reputation for innovation in architecture and design. Its list of famous architectsis 
long and impressive, and among the best-known are Frank Lloy Wright and the Bauhaus`s ownn Mies 
van der Rohe. Your program here will be designed to acquaint you with the „Chicago style“ through 
visits to noted firms, such as Skidmore Owings & Merill, or Holard & Root; through discussions with 
faculty at such noted academic institutions as the Illinois Institute of Technology and the /Art Institute 
of Chicago; and through visits to some of the city‘s most famous architectural examples, such as the 
John Hancock Tower. An evening of home hospitality will be scheduled.

Quite different from Chicago in climate, ambience, and style, San Francisco will offer you a wholly 
different view of contemporary Américan architecture and design. Among the possible stops are the 
University of California at Berkeley, whose architecture program has a longstanding reputation for 
innovative approaches to the relationship between space and the needs of the people who will be using 
it. The San Francisco Art Institute may also be visited and, with its combination of Spanish and con-
temporary architecture, will offer a unique blend of cultures in the housing of its galleries. Your San 
Francisco sponsor has been in contact with Professor Conrad Atkinson at the University of California 
at Davis, and it is possible that Dr. Atkinson and his wife will wish to travel to San Francisco to meet 
you. If they are unable to do so, arrangements will be made for a rental van to take you to Sacramento, 
a trip which would occupy the entire day. During one of vour evenings in San Francisco, you will have 
the opportunity to meet a number of Americans, some of whom are architects, in an informal social 
setting.

In Los Angeles, reputed to be where many American social trends originate, you will observe a lifestyle 
and ambience perhaps uniquely American. Southern Californian architecture also has its own charac-
teristic style, and several examples will be included in your program. A visit to the Southern California 
Institute of Architecture will enable you to discuss with faculty members some of the components of 
this region‘s approach to design. Similarly, your stop at the Art Center of Pasadena will enable you to 
receive another perspective. Prominent area architects, such as Frank Gehry, may also be included in 
your program. In addition to home hospitality, your sponsor in Los Angeles may be able to arrange an 
excursion to Disneyland.


